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Encounters in West Africa is perhaps unique in its kind, informative, critical and at the same time
entertaining. It gives an overview of West African history, the Transatlantic Slave Trade and the Amistad
Revolt. It refers to major events since the European colonialism; aspects of cultural heritage and traditional
beliefs in sorcery and witchcraft, secret societies, initiation and wedding ceremonies and the status of African
women.
The author explains how slavery fueled the engine of western economies through draining African wealth
and human resources and addresses the critical question "Why Africa endowed with rich resources remains
the world's poorest region in the twenty-first century!" In response, while recognizing the internal political
conditions and social instability as the major constraints, he blames the West and the United States in
particular for ignoring Africa despite giving much attention to some other territories. He then draws attention
to the pressing issues facing Africa and the challenging role of the international community and Western
media for a change of policy. The author believes that education should be given first priority in any donors'
assistance package to Africa which should include health care education and sharing knowledge and
technology transfer with effective community involvement.
The author's aim is to enrich the awareness of the reader about the potential resources, rich heritage and
traditional values of Africa with the hope to promote international partnership with the continent.
The last parts of the book cover the author's interesting memoirs, some advice to visitors before travelling to
the region and references to institutions and NGOs affiliated with West Africa.
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From reader reviews:

Jean Willis:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is known to
us that book is very important for people. The book Encounters in West Africa seemed to be making you to
know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you.
The book Encounters in West Africa is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to be your
friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your book. Try to make
relationship together with the book Encounters in West Africa. You never really feel lose out for everything
if you read some books.

Grace Seals:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Encounters in West Africa book
since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Crystal Thomas:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
learn a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, along with soon.
The Encounters in West Africa offer you a new experience in reading through a book.

Christopher Bohner:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has
reading's internal or real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go
to generally there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading through is not important,
boring as well as can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to
suit your needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says,
many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Encounters in West Africa can make you sense more
interested to read.
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