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If you’re a passionate photographer and you’re ready to take your work to the next level, The Enthusiast’s
Guide book series was created just for you. Whether you’re diving head first into a new topic or exploring a
classic theme, Enthusiast’s Guides are designed to help you quickly learn more about a topic or subject so
that you can improve your photography. These handy books don’t waste your time covering all the
photography basics you already know. Instead, they build on that knowledge so you can quickly advance
your photography skills.
The Enthusiast’s Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic Principles You Need to Know addresses what you
need to know in order to create great portraits in natural light. Chapters are broken down into a series of
numbered lessons, with each lesson providing all you need to improve your photography. Divided into eight
chapters that include 59 photographic lessons to help you shoot great portraits, photographer and author
Jerod Foster covers equipment, setup, light, composition, posing, color, storytelling, and post-processing.
Example lessons include:

8. Choosing a Lens and Focal Length●

10. Minimum Sustaining Shutter Speed●

13. The Three Degrees of Diffusion●

17. Modifying Natural Light●

21. Framing Your Subject●

29. Composing for Design●

33. The Nose and Cheek Line●

36. Working with Groups●

38. Letting Color Direct the Eye●

45. Creating Shot Lists●

Written in a friendly and approachable manner and illustrated with examples that drive home each lesson,
The Enthusiast’s Guide to Portraiture is designed to be effective and efficient, friendly and fun. Read an
entire chapter at once, or read just one topic at a time. With either approach, you’ll quickly learn a lot so you
can head out with your camera to capture great shots.
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From reader reviews:

Evelina Soria:

In other case, little individuals like to read book The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic
Principles You Need to Know. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we
know about how is important any book The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic Principles
You Need to Know. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by way of a book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can learn everything! From your country until eventually
foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In
this era, we could open a book or perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it
when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's examine.

Sonya Ewing:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
kind of aren't like that. This The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic Principles You Need to
Know book is readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are
arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to
provide to you. The writer involving The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic Principles You
Need to Know content conveys objective easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the information but it just different in the form of it. So , do you continue to thinking The
Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic Principles You Need to Know is not loveable to be your
top listing reading book?

Graham Ayala:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more
time to be read. The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic Principles You Need to Know can be
your answer given it can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.

Joseph Cosgrove:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but additionally novel and The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture:
59 Photographic Principles You Need to Know or others sources were given understanding for you. After
you know how the great a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for
teacher or students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In additional
case, beside science reserve, any other book likes The Enthusiast's Guide to Portraiture: 59 Photographic



Principles You Need to Know to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like
this.
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