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For recently laid-off Asia Crawford, an all-expenses-paid vacation to the Colorado Rockies--courtesy of her
sorority sisters--is just the getaway she needs. Until Trace Gunthrey shows up, claiming he's booked in the
same rustic cabin! The only solution? To split the two-week time-share. But with the gorgeous single father
sharing her intimate living space, sleep is the last thing on Asia's mind....

In Atlanta, Trace is a judge who moves in high-powered circles. Here, he's just a man at one with
nature...and the earthy beauty who seems set on seducing him. Trace came out West to get closer to his
daughter. Instead, Asia's the one who's bonding with both of them, making the captivated widower long to let
nature take its course--one scorching kiss at a time!
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From reader reviews:

Cody Smith:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a reserve you will get new information since book is one of several ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, studying a book will make you more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the people do it
anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Trail of Kisses (Kimani
Romance), you could tells your family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire
average, make them reading a reserve.

Omar Carter:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday.
The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to test look for
book, may be the publication untitled Trail of Kisses (Kimani Romance) can be good book to read. May be it
can be best activity to you.

Stephanie Gilley:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent all day long to reading a publication. The book Trail of Kisses (Kimani Romance) it is extremely good
to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In
case you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore
effortlessly to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book provides high
quality.

Kurt Chapman:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of Trail of Kisses (Kimani Romance) can give you a
lot of close friends because by you considering this one book you have matter that they don't and make an
individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This
e-book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than various other
make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have Trail of Kisses (Kimani Romance).
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