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Millions of Americans are spending billions of dollars each year buying megavitamin supplements in an
attempt to prevent or cure physical ailments from the common cold to cancer, avoid mental depression, and
starve off the effects of old age. What they don’t know is that not only are they wasting their money, but they
may be endangering their lives.

In Vitamin Politics, John Fried shows how we have been misled and manipulated by vitamin enthusiasts who
preach megavitamin therapy for a host of common ills. Operating without a conclusive body of proof, they
continue to promote massive doses of vitamins to a willing public that is more interested in miracle cures
than in reasoned scientific skepticism and caution.

Vitamins taken in megadoses are no longer vitamins—they are drugs. As drugs they can and do have
dangerous side effects. Numerous cases have been documented describing the effects suffered by those on
megavitamin regimens including lethargy, vomiting, loss of hair, enlarged livers and spleens, and abnormal
skull growth. But, Fried found, megavitamin proponents are more interested in publicity than scientific
investigation, and vitamin promoters are more involved in the economics of vitamin production than in
determining the effects of vitamins taken in large quantities.

Vitamin Politics, an update of Fried’s classic The Vitamin Conspiracy, combines the misinformation of
vitamin faddists and offers a well-reasoned, thoroughly researched report of the facts.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Glover:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Vitamin Politics. Try to face the book Vitamin Politics as
your good friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course
make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you a lot
more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience
in addition to knowledge with this book.

James Ponce:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled Vitamin
Politics? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have some other opinion?

Willard Griffin:

The publication untitled Vitamin Politics is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You can see the
quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you actually. The language that publisher use to explained
their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, so the
information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of
Vitamin Politics from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Donald Fujita:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get large
amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is Vitamin Politics.
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