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''We are stardust, meant to shine.'' Illuminate your place with this beautiful bookmark.

Antique-look art is based on a gold-tooled book binding created by the Henry T. Wood bindery of London●

in 1933.
Sun-, star- and planet-filled design, in gold and cerulean blue, gleams with gold foil highlighting.●

A gold bead with a raised sun design is attached to the silky gold tassel.●

Bookmark is printed on sturdy, smooth-finish cardstock.●

Comes encased in a protective clear plastic sleeve.●

Measures 2-1/2 inches wide by 7-1/8 inches high.●

Matches Peter Pauper Press's other Celestial gifts and stationery.●

Warning: Choking hazard, small parts. Not for children under 3 years.●
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From reader reviews:

Graciela Johnson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the book entitled Celestial Beaded Bookmark. Try to make book Celestial
Beaded Bookmark as your friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you sense alone and beside
that course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you much more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience as well as
knowledge with this book.

Jack Morgan:

The experience that you get from Celestial Beaded Bookmark will be the more deep you looking the
information that hide inside the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to comprehend but Celestial Beaded Bookmark giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer
conveys their point in particular way that can be understood simply by anyone who read that because the
author of this guide is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your own personal vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We advise you for having this kind of Celestial Beaded Bookmark instantly.

Joseph Levis:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
loved ones or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching
TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different
you can read a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day
long to reading a publication. The book Celestial Beaded Bookmark it is rather good to read. There are a lot
of folks that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from your
smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book offers high quality.

Isaac Lewis:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. In this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find the
Celestial Beaded Bookmark when you desired it?
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