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Elli Friedmann was fourteen years old in April 1945 when American soldiers liberated her from her Nazi
captors and the harrowing year she spent at Auschwitz and other concentration camps where Jews were mass
murdered. At the opening of this book, Elli, her mother, and brother, recently reunited, return to their home
in Czechoslovakia, expecting to pick up the lives they left behind. Instead, they confront the harsh realities of
a house stripped bare, a town occupied by strangers, and the news that Daddy will never return. The anti-
Semitism that still remains makes life there so oppressive that Elli and her family decide to immigrate to
America -- a journey that will take six harrowing years of waiting in one temporary shelter after another.
Along the way Elli builds bridges of hope for other Holocaust survivors. She rescues Jewish orphans from
rioting Slovak partisans, smuggles Jewish refugees to Palestine, and becomes a headmaster of a Jewish
school, all the while struggling with her nightmarish past and questions about her future. Her teenage years,
which culminate in a daring escape from behind the Iron Curtain, are a dizzying merry-go-round of danger,
excitement, and love. Thrilling, touching, and thought-provoking, this sequel to "I Have Lived a Thousand
Years" offers a firsthand glimpse into post-war Europe. Elli's indomitable spirit shines through every page,
making this an inspiring memoir.
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From reader reviews:

Wallace Long:

Here thing why this My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz are different and
reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of it which is
the content is as tasty as food or not. My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz
giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no
reserve that similar with My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz. It gives you
thrill reading through journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world
which is might be can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area,
café, or even in your method home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book
maybe the form of My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz in e-book can be your
choice.

Romana Linder:

The particular book My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz has a lot of
knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was
published by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to write this book. This specific
book very easy to read you may get the point easily after looking over this book.

Fred Martinez:

This My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz is new way for you who has intense
curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this My Bridges of
Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz can be the light food for yourself because the
information inside this book is easy to get by anyone. These books develop itself in the form that is certainly
reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel
sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one.
You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book
kind for your better life and also knowledge.

Larry Strickland:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen need book to know the change information of year in order to year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the
world. From the book My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz we can acquire
more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To become creative person must like to read a
book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at



this book My Bridges of Hope: Searching for Life and Love After Auschwitz. You can more appealing than
now.
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