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In this new collection of poems, Weary Kingdom, DéLana R. A. Dameron maps a journey across emotional,
spiritual, and geographic lines, from the familiarity of the honeysuckle South to a new world, or a new
kingdom?Harlem. Her poems traverse the streets of this Black mecca with a careful eye cast toward the
intimacies of the exterior. Still, as the poems move throughout the built environment, they navigate matters
of death, love, love loss, and family against the backdrop of a city that has yet to become home. Indeed what
looms over this weary kingdom is a longing for the certainties of a lover’s touch, the summer’s sun, and the
comforts of a promised land up North. And as the poet longs, so do readers. Ultimately they grow aware of
Utopia’s fragility.
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From reader reviews:

Brent Abramson:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge your information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
truly feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Weary
Kingdom: Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Tia Sargent:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying Weary Kingdom: Poems (Palmetto
Poetry Series) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading
routine all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world much better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading habit only for the geeky particular person but
for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through
as your good habit, it is possible to pick Weary Kingdom: Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) become your
personal starter.

Adele Yeager:

This Weary Kingdom: Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) is great book for you because the content which is
full of information for you who all always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This
particular book reveal it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can say no rambling sentences
in it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight
forward sentences but tricky core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Weary Kingdom:
Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous
one. We can say that no book that offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this reserve already do
that. So , this is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in which?

Sylvia Medina:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they get
a half regions of the book. You can choose typically the book Weary Kingdom: Poems (Palmetto Poetry
Series) to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you like
reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the feeling about book and looking
at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a book and go through it. Beside that the e-book
Weary Kingdom: Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) can to be your brand-new friend when you're really feel
alone and confuse in what must you're doing of the time.
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