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There may be nothing like a dame, but there's something about a sailor--Alfred Eisenstaedt's famous V-J Day
photo of a sailor sweeping a nurse off her feet in a jubilant kiss has a prominent place in our common
imaginations. Somewhere in the landscape of everyone's childhood there's a portrait of a sailor on a dusty
bureau top, evoking exotic travel and the romance of the sea. Who hasn't at one time dreamed of being a
sailor? From his trademark white cap to his bell-bottom pants, a boy in a sailor uniform is a byword for
fresh-faced youth and inexperience, optimistic and adventurous, up against the wiles of old salts and
sophisticated cities. He has "the good looks, cheery health, and frank enjoyment of young life" embodied in
Melville's Billy Budd. He's also an emblem of swaggering masculinity and romantic opportunity. Whether
pining for the girl he left behind or bragging of conquests in foreign ports-of-call like Hong Kong, Panama
City, or San Juan, we imagine him lonely and seeking companionship.

Sailor gathers from private collections over 150 never-before-published snapshots and portraits spanning
more than a century of maritime experience. The photographs in this book give us close-up glimpses of a
larger-than-life figure. For lovers of old photographs and serious collectors, for those with nostalgic
memories of Navy days and for anyone who has ever daydreamed of a sailor's life on the high seas--this is a
must-have volume. The images comprise a unique record of youthful exuberance and masculine
camaraderie, intriguing as artifacts and occasionally breathtaking in visual beauty. In their intimacy they
provide a fascinating and very human window on a mythic past.
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From reader reviews:

Adam Allen:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Sailor: Vintage Photos of a
Masculine Icon. All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet sources or
other social media.

Russell Stringer:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot
of new facts. When you read a guide you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways
to share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Sailor:
Vintage Photos of a Masculine Icon, you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Adam Mathews:

The particular book Sailor: Vintage Photos of a Masculine Icon has a lot details on it. So when you check out
this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The author
makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can get the point
easily after reading this book.

Linda Justice:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from
it. It is identified as of book Sailor: Vintage Photos of a Masculine Icon. You can add your knowledge by it.
Without causing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most
essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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