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A provocative, profoundly moving literary debut--part personal history, part cultural commentary--that
announces a writer of dazzling originality.

In an emotionally charged narrative that weaves together past and present, the personal and the scholarly, a
young critic and classicist takes us on a search for the meaning of identity--while showing, through
remarkably fresh and accessible readings of such classical Greek and Roman writers as Catullus and Sappho,
Ovid and Sophocles, how ancient stories  continue to hold truths for us today.

The landscapes through which Daniel Mendelsohn takes us: the deceptively quiet streets of the suburb where
he grew up, torn between his mathematician father, who sought after scientific truth, and his Orthodox
Jewish grandfather, who told "beautiful lies"; the Southern university, steeped in history and secret
traditions, where he first experienced seductions both sexual and intellectual; Internet chat rooms and the
streets of Chelsea, Manhattan's newest gay ghetto, where "desire for love" competes with "love of desire";
the quiet, moonlit house where a close friend's small son teaches him the meaning of fatherhood.

And, in a narrative tour de force that marks the book's conclusion, Mendelsohn's themes--desire and
sexuality, the hidden meanings of classical and Hebrew writings, the restless search for cultural and personal
identity--come together in a final revelation. In a neglected Jewish cemetery, the author uncovers a family
secret that demonstrates the universal need for storytelling, for inventing myths of the self.
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From reader reviews:

Carlos Callahan:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the headline The Elusive
Embrace: Desire and the Riddle of Identity suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known
writer in this era. The book untitled The Elusive Embrace: Desire and the Riddle of Identityis one of several
books that everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When
you read this publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know just before. The author explained
their plan in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this e-book.
This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the
world in this book.

Samantha Williams:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
study. The Elusive Embrace: Desire and the Riddle of Identity can be your answer since it can be read by
you who have those short time problems.

Cora Spillane:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you
to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book
that recommended to you is The Elusive Embrace: Desire and the Riddle of Identity this e-book consist a lot
of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how does the world has
grown up. The dialect styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. That is why this book appropriate all of you.

Silvia Washington:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every
year was exactly added. This e-book The Elusive Embrace: Desire and the Riddle of Identity was filled with
regards to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has different feel when they reading a book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can
truly feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.
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