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Reprint of: Cytogenetic and Genome Research 2006, Vol. 113, No. 1-4 Genomic imprinting, a parent-of-
origin-specific epigenetic modification of the genome, is observed in placental mammals and some plants
(angiosperms). Since its discovery in the early 1980s, this intriguing phenomenon has been intensively
investigated and has spawned an exciting new research area. Imprinting is relevant to a variety of biological
events such as embryogenesis, growth and behavior, and its disruption can lead to congenital malformation
syndromes and cancers. Furthermore, imprinting has been serving as an excellent model system to study
epigenetic mechanisms of gene regulation and helping us to understand how gene clusters and genome
domains are regulated. This special issue provides an overview of the current knowledge of genomic
imprinting. Including both excellent reviews and original research articles by outstanding researchers in the
field, many of which were participants of the genomic imprinting workshops in Montpellier (September
2004) and Oxford (April 2005), it represents the forefront of imprinting research.
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From reader reviews:

William Perez:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be update about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and progress. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Genomic Imprinting
(Cytogenetic and Genomic Research) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why,
since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Lisa Gonzales:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your current
free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing
you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to try out look for book, may be
the book untitled Genomic Imprinting (Cytogenetic and Genomic Research) can be very good book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

Gwendolyn Smith:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Genomic Imprinting
(Cytogenetic and Genomic Research) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply
reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far
better then how they react towards the world. It can't be said constantly that reading practice only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want
to start examining as your good habit, you are able to pick Genomic Imprinting (Cytogenetic and Genomic
Research) become your current starter.

Nancy Williams:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
issue was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must
know that reading is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to
something by book. Different categories of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is
niagra Genomic Imprinting (Cytogenetic and Genomic Research).
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