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Since its introduction at the 1904 World's Fair in St. Louis, iced tea has been a favorite American beverage
showing up at every family gathering, backyard barbecue, 4th of July picnic, and on every restaurant menu.
In fact, each day, 120 million Americans reach for a frosty glass of iced tea. Fred Thompson shows us how
easy it is to make a wide variety of iced teas right at home: from classics (Southern Style Ice Tea, Solar Tea)
to infusions (Iced Mango Tea, Berry Spice Iced Tea), from spritzers (Green Tea Passion Fruit Spritzer) to
offbeat and cocktail teas (Tea Smoothie, Beach Bourbon Slush).Thompson discusses basic methods for
brewing tea, the types of teas and tea blends that are best iced, as well as a vast array of flavors and flavorful
combinations that can be mixed with iced tea to create refreshing new drinks.These 50 recipes make iced tea
a truly exciting anytime beverage while still maintaining the pure flavor and goodness that has ensured its
place in American tradition.Thompson shares his years of experience brewing, tasting, and enjoying iced tea
the way it was meant to be made - at home with your own two hands.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Chan:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Iced Tea: 50 Recipes for Refreshing Tisanes, Infusions,
Coolers, and Spiked Teas (50 Series).

Diane Smith:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge to make
them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you don't
know what kind you should start with. This Iced Tea: 50 Recipes for Refreshing Tisanes, Infusions, Coolers,
and Spiked Teas (50 Series) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and wish in this era.

Lynnette Jennings:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Iced Tea: 50
Recipes for Refreshing Tisanes, Infusions, Coolers, and Spiked Teas (50 Series) suitable to you? Typically
the book was written by famous writer in this era. Typically the book untitled Iced Tea: 50 Recipes for
Refreshing Tisanes, Infusions, Coolers, and Spiked Teas (50 Series)is a single of several books this everyone
read now. This kind of book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this publication you will
enter the new shape that you ever know just before. The author explained their plan in the simple way, thus
all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this book. This book will give you a large amount of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world with this book.

William Matthews:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer may be Iced Tea: 50 Recipes for Refreshing Tisanes, Infusions,
Coolers, and Spiked Teas (50 Series) why because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the
content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover.
Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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