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In Service and Servitude explores the relationship between contemporary domestic service and the pursuit of
the "good life" in an era of global economic transformation. The author offers an interdisciplinary approach
to examining the in-migration of foreign domestic workers in Malaysia.

The book uses Malaysia as a case study of the role played by foreign domestics in a rapidly industrializing
Asian country. Christine Chin discusses how the state elites and the middle classes come to rationalize the
demand for-and treatment of-domestic workers while pursuing the country's modernity project, designed to
create a stable, developed, multiethnic society. She shows how different and competing pressures on the
regional, national, and household levels leave Filipina and Indonesian domestics open to mistreatment and
abuse, most directly by employment agencies and employers. Chin argues that late-twentieth-century efforts
to expand open markets and establish global free trade, encourage the exploitation of transnational migrant
workers, and that such exploitation should not become an acceptable part of pursuing the "good life."
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From reader reviews:

John Jacquez:

In other case, little persons like to read book In Service and Servitude. You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a book In Service and Servitude. You can
add information and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from
book you can understand everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a
book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel
uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Rosa Johnson:

The reserve untitled In Service and Servitude is the book that recommended to you to study. You can see the
quality of the e-book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that creator use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the
information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-
book of In Service and Servitude from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Lorraine Edler:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your
knowledge, because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The In Service and Servitude will give you new experience in studying a book.

Homer Simon:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this book. This In Service and Servitude is simple to bring
you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not possess much space to bring
the particular printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
often the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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