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This perennially popular book, now revised and expanded with additional historical photos and documents,
offers a concise introduction to Wisconsin's Norwegian immigrants. The narrative examines the mass
migration of Norwegians from 1837, when Ole Nattestad became the first Norwegian settler in Wisconsin, to
the late nineteenth century, when Norwegian immigration largely came to a close. This volume demonstrates
the efforts of immigrants to balance newfound American customs with the most treasured traditions of their
homeland.

New to this edition are selected letters of Ole Munch Ræder, a scholar sent by the Norwegian government in
1847 to study the American legal system. Ræder visited several Wisconsin cities and villiages and paid
special attention to the Norwegian community. His compelling accounts, which appeared in newspapers in
Norway, offer a contemporary view of Norwegian life in Wisconsin.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Lowe:

Within other case, little persons like to read book Norwegians in Wisconsin (Ethnic Series). You can choose
the best book if you want reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of book
Norwegians in Wisconsin (Ethnic Series). You can add know-how and of course you can around the world
by way of a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your country right
up until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You
need to use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

Anthony Thies:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of numerous
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this Norwegians in Wisconsin (Ethnic Series), you could tells your family,
friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them
reading a reserve.

Ida Green:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared
to can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time
to be study. Norwegians in Wisconsin (Ethnic Series) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by
you who have those short extra time problems.

Deon Henderson:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes studying, not
only science book but also novel and Norwegians in Wisconsin (Ethnic Series) or perhaps others sources
were given understanding for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel would like to read more
and more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those publications are
helping them to increase their knowledge. In some other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes
Norwegians in Wisconsin (Ethnic Series) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book
like this.
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