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Harrison Bentley, from the small village of Grant, is in the midst of an identity crisis. Unexpectedly finding
himself, his little brother, and a girl from school in trouble, he rides the train into a supernatural realm to
escape. In The Highlands, Harrison meets the Ransom, the hero of all stories, and discovers who he is and
his part to play in the larger plot. The Highlands Tunnel is as much a spiritual allegory as a fantasy piece,
inspired by the works of C. S. Lewis & John Eldredge, & Wm. P. Young’s novel The Shack.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Ray:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled The Highlands Tunnel: A Story Never Told. Try to make the book
The Highlands Tunnel: A Story Never Told as your friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you
experience alone and beside that of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
you. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let's
make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Wayne Millican:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended to your account is The Highlands Tunnel: A Story Never Told this guide consist a lot of
the information from the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented so why is the
world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual
writer made some research when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Margaret Gentile:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Highlands Tunnel: A Story Never Told
was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Highlands Tunnel: A Story
Never Told has many kinds or category. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Detective
Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you
bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and
try to like reading that.

Joseph Chitwood:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just seeking the The Highlands Tunnel: A Story Never Told when you essential it?
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