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THE FIRST MEMOIR BY A USS ARIZONA SURVIVOR: Donald Stratton, one of the battleship's
five living heroes, delivers an "epic,"* "powerful,"** and "intimate"** eyewitness account of Pearl
Harbor and his unforgettable return to the fight. A TOP-TEN NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER!

At 8:06 a.m. on December 7, 1941, Seaman First Class Donald Stratton was consumed by an inferno. A
million pounds of explosives had detonated beneath his battle station aboard the USS Arizona, barely fifteen
minutes into Japan’s surprise attack on American forces at Pearl Harbor. Near death and burned across two
thirds of his body, Don, a nineteen-year-old Nebraskan who had been steeled by the Great Depression and
Dust Bowl, summoned the will to haul himself hand over hand across a rope tethered to a neighboring
vessel. Forty-five feet below, the harbor’s flaming, oil-slick water boiled with enemy bullets; all around him
the world tore itself apart.

In this extraordinary never-before-told eyewitness account of the Pearl Harbor attack—the only memoir ever
written by a survivor of the USS Arizona—ninety-four-year-old veteran Donald Stratton finally shares his
unforgettable personal tale of bravery and survival on December 7, 1941, his harrowing recovery, and his
inspiring determination to return to the fight.

Don and four other sailors made it safely across the same line that morning, a small miracle on a day that
claimed the lives of 1,177 of their Arizona shipmates—approximately half the American fatalaties at Pearl
Harbor. Sent to military hospitals for a year, Don refused doctors’ advice to amputate his limbs and battled to
relearn how to walk. The U.S. Navy gave him a medical discharge, believing he would never again be fit for
service, but Don had unfinished business. In June 1944, he sailed back into the teeth of the Pacific War on a
destroyer, destined for combat in the crucial battles of Leyte Gulf, Luzon, and Okinawa, thus earning the
distinction of having been present for the opening shots and the final major battle of America’s Second
World War.

As the seventy-fifth anniversary of the Pearl Harbor attack approaches, Don, a great-grandfather of five and
one of five living survivors of the Arizona, offers an unprecedentedly intimate reflection on the tragedy that
drew America into the greatest armed conflict in history. All the Gallant Men is a book for the ages, one of
the most remarkable—and remarkably inspiring—memoirs of any kind to appear in recent years.

*New York Post

**Library Journal
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From reader reviews:

Joni Harris:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book called All the Gallant Men:
An American Sailor's Firsthand Account of Pearl Harbor? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
already know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Cheree Rodriquez:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find guide that need more time to be study.
All the Gallant Men: An American Sailor's Firsthand Account of Pearl Harbor can be your answer given it
can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.

Joan Davis:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this publication. This All the Gallant Men: An
American Sailor's Firsthand Account of Pearl Harbor is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation
area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular printed book, you
can buy the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone.
And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Mathew Casillas:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading
through a book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book
everywhere? It okay you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like All
the Gallant Men: An American Sailor's Firsthand Account of Pearl Harbor which is having the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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