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For centuries, the opulent and luxurious qualities of silk and velvet have made them treasured fabrics
throughout the world. To adventurous fiber artists, these sumptuous materials can be inviting, yet
intimidating. Textile Surface Decoration: Silk and Velvet provides the detailed guidance needed to transform
these fabrics into stunning new garments and original works of art.

In this book, veteran textile arts educator Margo Singer provides a thorough examination of the unique
properties of silk and velvet as well as the history and traditions of decorating these textiles. She then shows
how to produce traditional decorative effects using household materials and widely available craft supplies.
Make a velvet Japanese shibori scarf with the help of an empty glass bottle, some twine, and a blow dryer.
Cut acetate stencils to create a Fortuny-inspired Belle Époque design. If a calabash isn't available, use foam
blocks to recreate Ghanaian adinkra prints.

Textile Surface Decoration covers basic painting, immersion dyeing, block printing, and stenciling along
with a variety of resist, devoré, and discharge methods. Singer includes product recommendations and
formulas for mixing custom dyes. The book goes beyond dyeing into embroidery, foiling, and even slashing.
Numerous color photographs of traditional and contemporary fiber arts from around the world will inspire
both the weekend crafter and the devoted textile artist. From Scottish paisley to the mud cloth of Mali,
Textile Surface Decoration offers a world of ideas to enhance the most radiant of fabrics.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Vandyke:

With other case, little people like to read book Textile Surface Decoration: Silk and Velvet (Textiles
Handbooks). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important the book Textile Surface Decoration: Silk and Velvet (Textiles Handbooks). You can add expertise
and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can
learn everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book or perhaps searching by internet
gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Jacob Keys:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great and important the book Textile Surface Decoration: Silk and
Velvet (Textiles Handbooks). All type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the
internet options or other social media.

John Bullard:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Textile Surface Decoration: Silk
and Velvet (Textiles Handbooks) which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Edward Franco:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This e-book Textile Surface Decoration: Silk and Velvet (Textiles Handbooks) was filled
regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can truly feel
enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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