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With its combination of desert and mountain landscapes, the dramatic canyons of the Rio Grande, ancient
pictographs, and remnants of pioneer ranch life, Big Bend National Park presents a wealth of subjects to the
photographic eye. Add early morning and late evening sunlight, summer thunderstorms, and clear, star-
spattered night skies, and the opportunities become irresistible.

Professional nature photographer and frequent Big Bend traveler Kathy Adams Clark offers this handy and
beautiful guide to maximizing the photographic experience of this visually stunning landscape.

Photographing Big Bend National Park begins with a tutorial on the basics of light meters, shutter speeds,
and f/stops, featuring practical, hands-on-camera exercises and answers to common questions. The chapters
that follow take readers on six excursions to well-known locations within the park—the Basin, Panther
Junction, Rio Grande Village, Ross Maxwell Drive, Santa Elena Canyon, and the Chisos Mountains among
them. A primer on night photography (including “light-painting” and star trails) is also included.

Within each chapter are instructions for photographing various subjects at the site using simple, intermediate,
and advanced techniques; information on the best seasons to photograph; and tips designed to benefit the
novice.

Photographing Big Bend National Park not only provides practical information for photographers of all skill
levels, it also offers a visual feast of striking images. Nature lovers, photographers, and anyone who loves
this remarkable national park will treasure this latest book from veteran writer and photographer Kathy
Adams Clark.
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From reader reviews:

Alicia Gentry:

This Photographing Big Bend National Park: A Friendly Guide to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural
History Series) book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain
by reading this book is actually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get data which is
getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. That Photographing Big Bend National
Park: A Friendly Guide to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural History Series) without we comprehend
teach the one who examining it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry
Photographing Big Bend National Park: A Friendly Guide to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural History
Series) can bring whenever you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because
you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This Photographing Big Bend National Park: A
Friendly Guide to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural History Series) having excellent arrangement in
word in addition to layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Herb Baker:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How
individuals to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book.
Reading a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Photographing Big
Bend National Park: A Friendly Guide to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural History Series) book
because this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred percent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Sondra Spencer:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book method, more simple and reachable. This particular Photographing Big Bend National Park: A
Friendly Guide to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural History Series) can give you a lot of good friends
because by you checking out this one book you have factor that they don't and make a person more like an
interesting person. This specific book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer
you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than various other make you to be
great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let me have Photographing Big Bend National Park: A Friendly Guide
to Great Images (W. L. Moody Jr. Natural History Series).

Rose Ibarra:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's internal or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time



there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Photographing Big Bend National Park: A Friendly Guide to Great Images (W.
L. Moody Jr. Natural History Series) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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