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This book contains the first three Scab and Beads Mysteries. Locket's Away Scabs is a daredevil who likes to
take his bike off of some sweet jumps! He doesn’t usually land them, however, and the students of Steven A.
Mason Elementary School have given him a fitting nickname. Beads is a diva, who’s win at all costs attitude,
along with her superb abilities in both school and jewelry making, make her the number one detective at
Steven A. Mason Elementary School. Together, these two form a partnership and friendship that is
unstoppable. Milk Mayhem Heat, Humidity and Milk - Oh, my! In this second installment of Playground
Scene Investigation, the elementary school crime fighting duo, Scabs and Beads, are back. And this time
something stinks! Will they find the source of the smell in time, or will the students of Steven A. Mason
wind up in the biggest mess ever! Homework Heist A shriek rang out from across Mrs. Julie's classroom.
And thus begins the third book in the Playground Scene Investigation series! The smart kids aren't doing
their homework...or so it would appear. And unfortunately for Beads, she is one of the smart kids. Will she
be able to convince Mrs. Julie of their innocence? Or will they be forced to spend the rest of their lunches
with the worst teacher imaginable? Get a free audio book with your purchase!
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From reader reviews:

Paul Day:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important thing to bring us around
the world. Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide Scab and Beads: Books 1-3:
A Mystery Series Book For Kids Age 9-12 will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more
confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that open or reading a book make you
bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate
book with you?

Alejandro Wisdom:

Often the book Scab and Beads: Books 1-3: A Mystery Series Book For Kids Age 9-12 will bring someone
to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In
the event you try to find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The book Scab and Beads: Books
1-3: A Mystery Series Book For Kids Age 9-12 is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get
the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Donna Davis:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day long to reading a
publication. The book Scab and Beads: Books 1-3: A Mystery Series Book For Kids Age 9-12 it is rather
good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book.
When you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very
easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

Belinda Bridges:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
identified as of book Scab and Beads: Books 1-3: A Mystery Series Book For Kids Age 9-12. You can
include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a
person happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one
destination to other place.
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