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Florida offers more than a thousand accessible and affordable golf courses, which attract more than two
million golfers every year. Moore’s guide to 60 golfing venues in the Sunshine State caters to all budgets by
featuring public courses, semi-private clubs where daily-fee players are welcome, and resorts that offer on-
site accommodations.
            Moore explores each course’s character—from its architect, design, and history to an analysis of each
hole, including advice on drive and approach shots and helpful observations on hazards and putting surfaces.
Arranged in four geographical sections with maps showing course locations and featuring 100 black-and-
white and 20 color photographs, this guide includes detailed directions allowing easy access from the nearest
interstates and other major roads. Moore also includes current green fees, phone numbers, and Web sites, as
well as yardage and course and slope ratings for blue and red tees.
            As a bonus, Moore directs golfers to places of history—such as the course where Jack Nicklaus once
carded a 7 and the 1920s resort where Johnny Weissmuller was a lifeguard. Both the recreational golfer and
the keen student of the sport will find Florida’s Fairways a handy, richly informative, and enjoyable guide.
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From reader reviews:

Janet Roldan:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what yours problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have
spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have time?
What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due to the
fact just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and Affordable
Golf Courses from the Panhandle to the Keys to read.

William Boehme:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained within the straightway,
hold on guys this specific aren't like that. This Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and Affordable Golf Courses
from the Panhandle to the Keys book is readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You will
find the info here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving possibly decrease the
knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer regarding Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and Affordable
Golf Courses from the Panhandle to the Keys content conveys prospect easily to understand by most people.
The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different available as it. So , do you
still thinking Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and Affordable Golf Courses from the Panhandle to the Keys is
not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Martin Dowling:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and Affordable Golf Courses from the Panhandle to the Keys your thoughts
will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but
surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve then become one type conclusion
and explanation in which maybe you never get just before. The Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and
Affordable Golf Courses from the Panhandle to the Keys giving you one more experience more than blown
away your head but also giving you useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us teach you the
relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining
it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Julie Chambers:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news.
In this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add



your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just searching for
the Florida's Fairways: 60 Alluring and Affordable Golf Courses from the Panhandle to the Keys when you
necessary it?
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