
Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets
(Guildhall Research Studies)

Graham Johnson

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0754659607
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0754659607
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0754659607


Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets (Guildhall
Research Studies)

Graham Johnson

Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets (Guildhall Research Studies) Graham Johnson
The career of Gabriel Fauré as a composer of songs for voice and piano traverses six decades (1862-1921);
almost the whole history of French mélodie is contained within these parameters. In the 1860s Fauré, the
lifelong protégé of Camille Saint-SaÃ«ns, was a suavely precocious student; he was part of Pauline Viardot's
circle in the 1870s and he nearly married her daughter. Pointed in the direction of symbolist poetry by Robert
de Montesquiou in 1886, Fauré was the favoured composer from the early 1890s of Winnarretta Singer, later
Princesse de Polignac, and his songs were revered by Marcel Proust. In 1905 he became director of the Paris
Conservatoire, and he composed his most profound music in old age. His existence, steadily productive and
outwardly imperturbable, was undermined by self-doubt, an unhappy marriage and a tragic loss of hearing.
In this detailed study Graham Johnson places the vocal music within twin contexts: Fauré's own life story,
and the parallel lives of his many poets. We encounter such giants as Charles Baudelaire and Paul Verlaine,
the patrician Leconte de Lisle, the forgotten Armand Silvestre and the Belgian symbolist Charles Van
Lerberghe. The chronological range of the narrative encompasses Fauré's first poet, Victor Hugo, who railed
against Napoleon III in the 1850s, and the last, Jean de La Ville de Mirmont, killed in action in the First
World War. In this comprehensive and richly illustrated study each of Fauré's 109 songs receives a separate
commentary. Additional chapters for the student singer and serious music lover discuss interpretation and
performance in both aesthetical and practical terms. Richard Stokes provides parallel English translations of
the original French texts. In the twenty-first century musical modernity is evaluated differently from the way
it was assessed thirty years ago. Fauré is no longer merely a 'Master of Charms' circumscribed by the belle
époque. His status as a great composer of timeless
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From reader reviews:

Donna Clark:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As it is known
to us that book is very important for people. The book Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets (Guildhall
Research Studies) has been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The reserve Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets (Guildhall
Research Studies) is not only giving you far more new information but also to become your friend when you
feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship while
using book Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets (Guildhall Research Studies). You never truly feel lose
out for everything if you read some books.

Virginia Dunn:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming
to a person is you don't know what one you should start with. This Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets
(Guildhall Research Studies) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this
book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Lupe Ware:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their
Poets (Guildhall Research Studies) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading
this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far better
then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who
want to start looking at as your good habit, you could pick Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets
(Guildhall Research Studies) become your personal starter.

Geraldine Moreno:

As we know that book is important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This publication Gabriel Fauré: The Songs and their Poets (Guildhall Research Studies)
was filled with regards to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has different feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit of a
book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you
wanted.
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