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Tree Lines unites striking ink drawings of high-altitude pine trees with poetic vignettes about how people
interact with mountain environments. The drawings and text work together to form a direct artistic encounter
with timberline conifers. The husband and wife team of Valerie and Michael Cohen employ a unique process
whereby she draws in isolation, gives him her drawings, and he then writes whatever he’s inspired to create.
Neither offers the other any kind of feedback or instruction. The result is an accessible and deeply engaging
work that is also extremely well researched; the Cohens bring a lifetime of scholarship in literature, history,
and the environment to this work.

The drawings are black-and-white, pen-and-ink representations of high alpine ecosystems. The prose is
stripped bare, abbreviated in an epigrammatic style that is poetic and spontaneous. Trees represented here are
the Western Juniper or Sierra Juniper, the Limber, and the Bristlecone Pine—three species of long-lived,
slow-growing conifers that grow across the Great Basin. While they represent only a small portion of the
vegetative culture high in the western mountains, the Cohens use representation as abstraction as is utilized
by writers and artists to convey a unique kind of microcosm of our natural environment. This book compares
to such classics as Leopold’s A Sand County Almanac, and Berger’s Ways of Seeing, which open up lines of
observation, analysis, and art for a new generation of readers. 
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Gross:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Tree Lines.

Robin Blakely:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Tree Lines. All type of book is it
possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

David McKenney:

This Tree Lines is great reserve for you because the content that is full of information for you who always
deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately
using great arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read this hurriedly
you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Tree Lines in your hand like obtaining the world in
your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no book that offer you world in ten or
fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs.
hectic do you still doubt in which?

Victor Elias:

This Tree Lines is brand new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information as it relief
your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having
small amount of digest in reading this Tree Lines can be the light food in your case because the information
inside this kind of book is easy to get by anyone. These books develop itself in the form that is certainly
reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in publication
form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss
this! Just read this e-book style for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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