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Clowns: In Conversation with Modern Masters is a groundbreaking collection of conversations with 20 of
the greatest clowns on earth. In discussion with clown aficionados Ezra LeBank and David Bridel, these
legends of comedy reveal the origins, inspirations, techniques, and philosophies that underpin their
remarkable odysseys. Featuring incomparable artists, including Slava Polunin, Bill Irwin, David Shiner, Oleg
Popov, Dimitri, Nola Rae, and many more, Clowns is a unique and definitive study on the art of clowning.

In Clowns, these 20 master artists speak candidly about their first encounters with clowning and circus, the
crucial decisions that carved out the foundations of their style, and the role of teachers and mentors who
shaped their development. Follow the twists and turns that changed the direction of their art and careers,
explore the role of failure and originality in their lives and performances, and examine the development and
evolution of the signature routines that became each clown’s trademark. The discussions culminate in
meditations on the role of clowning in the modern world, as these great practitioners share their perspectives
on the mysterious, elusive art of the clown.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Dudley:

The book Clowns: In conversation with modern masters can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Clowns: In conversation
with modern masters? A few of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book
can give many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or
information that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Clowns: In
conversation with modern masters has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you.
You can appear the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Neil Myers:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stay than other
is high. For yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Clowns: In conversation
with modern masters book as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Becky Duncan:

Clowns: In conversation with modern masters can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article
author giving his/her effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Clowns: In conversation
with modern masters although doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm
resource facts that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information may drawn you into brand-
new stage of crucial contemplating.

Travis Smith:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
a book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social similar to
newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the
Clowns: In conversation with modern masters when you desired it?
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