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Part autobiography, part firm history and part a look at the future of urban design, Designing Places for
People and the Environment addresses lessons learned from fifty-five years of experience in urban design
and planning from a personal perspective, following the author’s formative education and work as an
architect, Naval civil engineer and city planner before transitioning into landscape architecture where he
grew into a leadership role as the first president of the SWA Group and shaped the firm as an employee-
owned group practice that, over four decades, has become a “world leader in landscape architecture,
planning and urban design”. More than just a monograph, the book relates important developments in the
firm and profession to major world events of the late 20th and early 21st centuries, using thirty-five case
studies of his major work and portfolios of the firm's iconic work over its entire history to date, and a “best
practices” section detailing how the firm has developed business and professional practices that allow it to
focus on its people and work: planning, designing and building livable and environmentally sustainable cities
and communities where people can live in dignity, health and happiness.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Reed:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you want something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time?
What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They have to answer that question simply because
just their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate.
Because start from on guardería until university need this particular Designing Places for People and the
Environment: Lessons from 55 years as an Urban Planner and Shaping the Global Landscape Architectural
Practice of the SWA Group to read.

Joseph Alderete:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about
the data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is this
Designing Places for People and the Environment: Lessons from 55 years as an Urban Planner and Shaping
the Global Landscape Architectural Practice of the SWA Group.

Barbara Robbins:

The publication with title Designing Places for People and the Environment: Lessons from 55 years as an
Urban Planner and Shaping the Global Landscape Architectural Practice of the SWA Group posesses a lot of
information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist
new understanding the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world currently.
That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you
with new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read that
anywhere you want.

Josephine Draughn:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of
book Designing Places for People and the Environment: Lessons from 55 years as an Urban Planner and
Shaping the Global Landscape Architectural Practice of the SWA Group. You can add your knowledge by it.



Without making the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is
most significant that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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