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This book applies model theoretic methods to the study of certain finite permutation groups, the
automorphism groups of structures for a fixed finite language with a bounded number of orbits on 4-tuples.
Primitive permutation groups of this type have been classified by Kantor, Liebeck, and Macpherson, using
the classification of the finite simple groups.

Building on this work, Gregory Cherlin and Ehud Hrushovski here treat the general case by developing
analogs of the model theoretic methods of geometric stability theory. The work lies at the juncture of
permutation group theory, model theory, classical geometries, and combinatorics.

The principal results are finite theorems, an associated analysis of computational issues, and an "intrinsic"
characterization of the permutation groups (or finite structures) under consideration. The main finiteness
theorem shows that the structures under consideration fall naturally into finitely many families, with each
family parametrized by finitely many numerical invariants (dimensions of associated coordinating
geometries).

The authors provide a case study in the extension of methods of stable model theory to a nonstable context,
related to work on Shelah's "simple theories." They also generalize Lachlan's results on stable homogeneous
structures for finite relational languages, solving problems of effectivity left open by that case. Their
methods involve the analysis of groups interpretable in these structures, an analog of Zilber's envelopes, and
the combinatorics of the underlying geometries. Taking geometric stability theory into new territory, this
book is for mathematicians interested in model theory and group theory.
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From reader reviews:

Jeraldine Thurman:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They need to answer that question since just
their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper. Because
start from on jardín de infancia until university need this Finite Structures with Few Types. (AM-152)
(Annals of Mathematics Studies) to read.

Bridget Carter:

This Finite Structures with Few Types. (AM-152) (Annals of Mathematics Studies) are generally reliable for
you who want to be a successful person, why. The main reason of this Finite Structures with Few Types.
(AM-152) (Annals of Mathematics Studies) can be one of many great books you must have is definitely
giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed a person with information that possibly will shock
your earlier knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Finite Structures with Few Types. (AM-152) (Annals
of Mathematics Studies) giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you tryout
of critical thinking that could it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

David Musick:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular book you have
read will be Finite Structures with Few Types. (AM-152) (Annals of Mathematics Studies).

Odelia Dennis:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Finite Structures with Few
Types. (AM-152) (Annals of Mathematics Studies) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out
this book? Let's view.
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