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200 formulas for making paints, glazes, mediums, varnishes, grounds, fixatives, sizes, and adhesives for
tempera, oil, acrylic, gouache, pastel, encaustic, fresco, and other painting techniques.

Here is a unique reference book which every serious painter will find indispensable. Formulas for Painters
gathers for the first time in a single volume over 200 recipes for making sizes, grounds, mediums, glazes,
varnishes, fixatives, and adhesives. These recipes—some dating as far back as the Renaissance—have been
tested by artists through the ages and retested by the author under controlled laboratory conditions. There are
forty-two recipes for paints alone, ranging from ancient encaustic and tempera to modern acrylic and silica
resins, dozens of mediums for every purpose, and a score of grounds for canvas, panels, and fresco.

Each formula is presented in a uniform format which explains the purpose of the material being made,
specifies precise ingredients, and gives clear directions for manufacture and use. For quick reference, all the
formulas are numbered and frequently cross-referenced. Formulas for Painters also contains a section of
notes on studio equipment; substitutes for hard-to-find materials; a fund of practical tips and miscellaneous
information; and useful tables of drying times, solvents, melting points—making this comprehensive,
compact handbook an invaluable source of reference for painters in all media.
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Adkins:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Formulas for
Painters suitable to you? Typically the book was written by well-known writer in this era. The actual book
untitled Formulas for Paintersis one of several books this everyone read now. This particular book was
inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new dimension that
you ever know just before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, so all of people can easily
to understand the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So
you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Lily Sawyers:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely without a
doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read is usually Formulas for Painters.

Marilyn Calhoun:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled
Formulas for Painters your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect
that maybe unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
publication then become one contact form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get just before.
The Formulas for Painters giving you an additional experience more than blown away the mind but also
giving you useful data for your better life within this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern is
your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a game. Do
you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Meghan Drucker:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Formulas for Painters book written by well-
known writer we are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who else read the
book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own
personal hunger then you still doubt Formulas for Painters as good book not only by the cover but also from
the content. This is one reserve that can break don't judge book by its cover, so do you still needing one more
sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you so why you have to
listening to another sixth sense.
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