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Mathematica by Example, Revised Edition presents the commands and applications of Mathematica, a
system for doing mathematics on a computer. This text serves as a guide to beginning users of Mathematica
and users who do not intend to take advantage of the more specialized applications of Mathematica.

The book combines symbolic manipulation, numerical mathematics, outstanding graphics, and a
sophisticated programming language. It is comprised of 7 chapters. Chapter 1 gives a brief background of the
software and how to install it in the computer. Chapter 2 introduces the essential commands of Mathematica.
Basic operations on numbers, expressions, and functions are introduced and discussed. Chapter 3 provides
Mathematica's built-in calculus commands. The fourth chapter presents elementary operations on lists and
tables. This chapter is a prerequisite for Chapter 5 which discusses nested lists and tables in detail. The
purpose of Chapter 6 is to illustrate various computations Mathematica can perform when solving
differential equations. Chapter 7 discusses some of the more frequently used commands contained in various
graphics packages available with Mathematica.

Engineers, computer scientists, physical scientists, mathematicians, business professionals, and students will
find the book useful.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Dickens:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high.
For you personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular Mathematica®
by Example book as starter and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Donna Casey:

The guide untitled Mathematica® by Example is the e-book that recommended to you to study. You can see
the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis
when write the book, hence the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could
possibly get the e-book of Mathematica® by Example from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Melissa Jackson:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. That Mathematica® by Example can give you a lot of good
friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have matter that they don't and make you more
like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than some other make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? Let's have Mathematica® by Example.

Harry Fulford:

You can obtain this Mathematica® by Example by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or
reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era
such as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now,
choose your current ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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