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Christian congregations, like just about everything else in our culture, are undergoing tremendous change.
That's not a huge revelation. Almost everyone involved with congregations agrees with that statement,
because we live with that reality. One of the central changes for congregations today is that they are no
longer the center of social and cultural life in most communities. Today, depending on where you live,
churches are somewhere between slightly off center and all the way at the margins of centers of social
influence in their communities. Perhaps no group of churches has experienced this shift more dramatically
than "Old First" churches. Another change is that denominational organizations are no longer the repository
of all resources, services, and expertise that congregations need to be effective. Often, the true "experts" are
not denominational organizations, but other congregations. The best denominational organizations see their
task, primarily, as cultivating a network of churches and ministry partners and connecting them to one
another as a community of mutual learning and resourcing.With these changes in mind, Cooperative Baptist
Fellowship of North Carolina (CBFNC) partnered with First Baptist Church Wilmington and others in 2010
to produce the first "Hopeful Imagination" conference. The centerpiece of the conference was telling the
story of FBC Wilmington in the words of its leaders. It was a story of how an "Old First" church adapted to
our changing times and managed not only to survive, but also to thrive. In addition to the resource of the
FBC story, we brought in other leaders who made contributions to the corporate learning. Teams of
congregational leaders attended the conference, listened to the stories, and returned home to apply their
learning in their own congregations and communities.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Clark:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication Hopeful Imagination will make you
to always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you
think that will open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they could be
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or ideal book with you?

Susan Granger:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Hopeful Imagination your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that
maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a
book then become one form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The Hopeful
Imagination giving you an additional experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you
useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern this is your
body and mind will be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning an activity. Do you
want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Barbara Kelley:

This Hopeful Imagination is new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information mainly
because it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or
you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Hopeful Imagination can be the light food for you
personally because the information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books acquire
itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who
think that in e-book form make them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is
absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for anyone. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book variety for your better life along with knowledge.

Joel Peterson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you know that
little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand that reading
is very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them are these claims Hopeful
Imagination.
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