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Nobel Prize winner Yasunari Kawabata’s Thousand Cranes is a luminous story of desire, regret, and the
almost sensual nostalgia that binds the living to the dead.
 
While attending a traditional tea ceremony in the aftermath of his parents’ deaths, Kikuji encounters his
father’s former mistress, Mrs. Ota. At first Kikuji is appalled by her indelicate nature, but it is not long
before he succumbs to passion—a passion with tragic and unforeseen consequences, not just for the two
lovers, but also for Mrs. Ota’s daughter, to whom Kikuji’s attachments soon extend. Death, jealousy, and
attraction convene around the delicate art of the tea ceremony, where every gesture is imbued with profound
meaning.
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From reader reviews:

Bernard McLaren:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Thousand Cranes.

Archie Moriarty:

The book Thousand Cranes make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable
far more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with the
subject. If you can make examining a book Thousand Cranes for being your habit, you can get much more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like open and read a reserve Thousand Cranes. Kinds of book are a lot of.
It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this publication?

Lila Smith:

The guide untitled Thousand Cranes is the e-book that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality
of the publication content that will be shown to you actually. The language that author use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the
information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Thousand Cranes
from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Robert Fox:

Beside this specific Thousand Cranes in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Thousand
Cranes because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you often have book but you do
not get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable
blend here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss
that? Find this book as well as read it from currently!
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