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Behold That Star! is an inspiring Christmas cantata that radiates the creative artistry and partnership of Jay
Althouse and Sally K. Albrecht. As the Prince of Peace comes to bring light to a people in darkness, we
travel by starlight on our Christmas journey. An inventive blend of scripture and hymn texts tells the story.
An optional congregational candlelight ceremony adds a special touch as children's voices (opt. solo) and
choir combine in strains of Silent Night. Christmas spirituals provide a joyous finale as the choir concludes,
"Behold that star of glory! It is the star of Bethlehem!" Designed for incorporation into regular Christmas or
Advent worship services, Behold That Star! may also be lengthened to create a special seasonal program or
pageant by adding costumes and simple staging. Approximately 25 minutes long, it may be accompanied by
keyboard alone or with additional instruments consisting of 2 trumpets, 2 trombones, flute, 2 clarinets and
percussion. Both the instrumental parts and a fully-orchestrated performance/accompaniment CD recording
are available separately.
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From reader reviews:

Claire Underwood:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the book entitled Behold That Star!: SATB Choral Score, Choral Score. Try
to make the book Behold That Star!: SATB Choral Score, Choral Score as your buddy. It means that it can to
get your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than
previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you
can know almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this
book.

Todd Voss:

Beside this Behold That Star!: SATB Choral Score, Choral Score in your phone, it may give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from
the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow village. It is good thing to
have Behold That Star!: SATB Choral Score, Choral Score because this book offers for your requirements
readable information. Do you at times have book but you rarely get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on,
that would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this? Find this book in addition to read it
from at this point!

Tammy Booker:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every
year has been exactly added. This e-book Behold That Star!: SATB Choral Score, Choral Score was filled in
relation to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has various feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can
experience enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Susan Garrard:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just looking for the Behold That Star!: SATB Choral Score, Choral Score when you essential it?
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