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"Conferencing Handbook: The New Real Justice Training Manual" by Terry O'Connell, Ben Wachtel and
Ted Wachtel is a clearly conceived procedural guide to coordinating and facilitating conferences, covering
the process of selecting cases, inviting participants, making preparations and running the conference itself. It
is useful to anyone who wants to learn to facilitate conferences in school, criminal justice and other settings.

The handbook begins with a chapter called "The Script," which presents the conference script and discusses
its origins, the psychological and sociological theory used to develop the script, and the reasons why one
would use a script.

Chapter 2, "When to Run a Conference," discusses criteria for deciding whether to run a conference, who
should facilitate conferences, needs of victims, and when a conference is not appropriate.

Chapter 3, "Conference Preparation," provides detailed instruction on choosing a time and place for a
conference, selecting and inviting participants, developing a seating plan, and making preparations.

Chapter 4, "Running the Conference," takes the reader through the conference process, from setting up
before the conference and seating participants to reaching an agreement and closing the conference. Each
section of the script is explained with suggestions on how to handle various situations that arise.

Chapter 5, "Establishing a Conferencing Program," offers advice to program coordinators, complemented by
a plethora of sample literature and forms from actual conferencing programs, including Central City
Neighborhoods Partnership (Minnesota), Piedmont Dispute Resolution Center (Virginia), and Hawke's Bay
Restorative Justice Te Puna Wai Ora (New Zealand).

The last chapter, "Restorative Practices -- Beyond the Formal Conference," provides a framework, examples
and practical suggestions for incorporating the language and philosophy of the conference script in a range of
less formal restorative interventions.

The 168-page Handbook includes several illustrative diagrams, a preparation checklist, a conference seating
planner, and data forms for record-keeping and conference evaluation. Quotes in the side margins highlight
key points from the text.
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From reader reviews:

Jaime Leflore:

Do you one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training Manual book is readable by
you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer regarding
Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training Manual content conveys the thought easily to
understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just
different by means of it. So , do you still thinking Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training
Manual is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Patrina Eaton:

The reason why? Because this Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training Manual is an unordinary
book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will shock you with the secret
that inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such awesome way
makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning
thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it.
This unique book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have such as help improving your talent
and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go
to the guide store hurriedly.

Katrina Varga:

Beside this particular Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training Manual in your phone, it could
give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are
going to got here is fresh from your oven so don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in
narrow village. It is good thing to have Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training Manual because
this book offers to you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get what it's facts
concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it?
Find this book and read it from currently!

Mandy Jackson:

You may get this Conferencing Handbook: New Real Justice Training Manual by check out the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties on your knowledge.
Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the
modern era such as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to



arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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