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From the classics to the hits of today, these timeless tunes are now available as easy arrangements for Flute,
Clarinet, Alto Sax, Tenor Sax, Trumpet, Horn in F, and Trombone. All wind instrument arrangements are
fully compatible and can be successfully performed as ensembles or solos. A fully orchestrated
accompaniment CD is provided, featuring each song as a live performance demo track followed by a play-
along track. Titles: Boulevard of Broken Dreams (Green Day) * Celebration (Kool and the Gang) * My
Immortal (Evanescence) * Na Na Hey Hey Kiss Him Goodbye (Steam) * New Soul (Yael Naïm) * Old Time
Rock & Roll (Bob Seger & The Silver Bullet Band) * Open Arms (Journey) * (I Can't Get No) Satisfaction
(The Rolling Stones) * Smooth (Santana featuring Rob Thomas) * Stairway to Heaven (Led Zeppelin) *
Take It Easy (Eagles) * You and Me (Lifehouse). This title is available in SmartMusic.
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From reader reviews:

Juan Palmer:

Often the book Easy Rock Instrumental Solos, Level 1: Flute, Book & CD (Easy Instrumental Solos) has a
lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very
famous author. The writer makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to
read you may get the point easily after looking over this book.

Robert Hollinger:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely indeed.
People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you have when the spare time
coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading textbooks. It
can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the particular book you have read is usually Easy
Rock Instrumental Solos, Level 1: Flute, Book & CD (Easy Instrumental Solos).

Jean Gonzales:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Easy Rock Instrumental Solos,
Level 1: Flute, Book & CD (Easy Instrumental Solos) publication written by well-known writer who knows
well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written within good
manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still
uncertainty Easy Rock Instrumental Solos, Level 1: Flute, Book & CD (Easy Instrumental Solos) as good
book but not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess
book by its cover, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your
reading through sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

William Powers:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top book
for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of book Easy Rock
Instrumental Solos, Level 1: Flute, Book & CD (Easy Instrumental Solos). Contain your knowledge by it.
Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is
most essential that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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