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In a lively challenge to mainstream history, Michael Parenti does battle with a number of mass-marketed
historical myths. He shows how history's victors distort and suppress the documentary record in order to
perpetuate their power and privilege. And he demonstrates how historians are influenced by the professional
and class environment in which they work. Pursuing themes ranging from antiquity to modern times, from
the Inquisition and Joan of Arc to the anti-labor bias of present-day history books, History as Mystery
demonstrates how past and present can inform each other and how history can be a truly exciting and
engaging subject.

"Michael Parenti, always provocative and eloquent, gives us a lively as well as valuable critique of
orthodoxy posing as ‘history.’"—Howard Zinn, author of A People's History of the United States

"Deserves to become an instant classic." —Bertell Ollman, author of Dialectical Investigations

Those who keep secret the past, and lie about it, condemn us to repeat it. Michael Parenti unveils the history
of falsified history, from the early Christian church to the present: a fascinating, darkly revelatory tale."
—Daniel Ellsberg, author of The Pentagon Papers

"Solid if surely controversial stuff."—Kirkus

Michael Parenti, PhD Yale, is an internationally known author and lecturer. He is one of the nation's leadiing
progressive political analysts. He is the author of over 275 published articles and twenty books, including
Against Empire, Dirty Truths, and Blackshirts and Reds. His writings are published in popular periodicals,
scholarly journals, and his op-ed pieces have been in leading newspapers such as the New York Times and the
Los Angeles Times. His informative and entertaining books and talks have reached a wide range of audiences
in North America and abroad.
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From reader reviews:

Marvin Gamez:

This History as Mystery book is not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you have by reading this book will be information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get
data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This History as Mystery
without we realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up
being worry History as Mystery can bring once you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn
into full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This History as Mystery having
excellent arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Howard Kincaid:

Here thing why this specific History as Mystery are different and trusted to be yours. First of all studying a
book is good however it depends in the content than it which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not.
History as Mystery giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any reserve out there but
there is no guide that similar with History as Mystery. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up
your current eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is probably can be happened around
you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your approach home by train.
Should you be having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of History as Mystery in e-
book can be your alternative.

Kenneth Vargas:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to
you personally is History as Mystery this book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world
now. This specific book was represented how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer
use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research when he makes this book. That
is why this book suitable all of you.

Scott Rochelle:

Beside this History as Mystery in your phone, it can give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or
info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from oven so don't become worry if you
feel like an old people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have History as Mystery because this
book offers to you readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you rarely get what it's exactly
about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here
cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this
book as well as read it from today!
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