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An extraordinarily frank, honest, and generous book by one of America's most famous and admired women -
- a book that is, as its title suggests, composed of both personal memoir and history.

It is the story of Graham's parents: the multimillionaire father who left private business and government
service to buy and restore the down-and-out Washington Post, and the formidable, self-absorbed mother
who was more interested in her political and charity work, and her passionate friendships with men like
Thomas Mann and Adlai Stevenson, than in her children.

It is the story of how The Washington Post struggled to succeed -- a fascinating and instructive business
history as told from the inside (the paper has been run by Graham herself, her father, her husband, and now
her son).

It is the story of Phil Graham -- Kay's brilliant, charismatic husband (he clerked for two Supreme Court
justices) -- whose plunge into manic-depression, betrayal, and eventual suicide is movingly and charitably
recounted.

Best of all, it is the story of Kay Graham herself. She was brought up in a family of great wealth, yet she
learned and understood nothing about money. She is half-Jewish, yet -- incredibly -- remained unaware of it
for many years.She describes herself as having been naive and awkward, yet intelligent and energetic. She
married a man she worshipped, and he fascinated and educated her, and then, in his illness, turned from her
and abused her. This destruction of her confidence and happiness is a drama in itself, followed by the even
more intense drama of her new life as the head of a great newspaper and a great company, a famous (and
even feared) woman in her own right. Hers is a life that came into its own with a vengeance -- a success story
on every level.

Graham's book is populated with a cast of fascinating characters, from fifty years of presidents (and their
wives), to Steichen, Brancusi, Felix Frankfurter, Warren Buffett (her great advisor and protector), Robert
McNamara, George Schultz (her regular tennis partner), and, of course, the great names from the Post:
Woodward, Bernstein, and Graham's editor/partner, Ben Bradlee. She writes of them, and of the most
dramatic moments of her stewardship of the Post (including the Pentagon Papers, Watergate, and the
pressmen's strike), with acuity, humor, and good judgment. Her book is about learning by doing, about
growing and growing up, about Washington, and about a woman liberated by both circumstance and her own
great strengths.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Taylor:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the people do
it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Personal History, you
are able to tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others,
make them reading a reserve.

Robert Kuehner:

The publication with title Personal History includes a lot of information that you can understand it. You can
get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new know-how the information that exist in this
e-book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You
can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Robert Carlson:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the
book you have read is usually Personal History.

Karen Saldivar:

This Personal History is great reserve for you because the content which can be full of information for you
who also always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it
information accurately using great plan word or we can state no rambling sentences within it. So if you are
read it hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Personal History in your hand
like obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no reserve
that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this book already do that. So , this can be good
reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that will?
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