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Faugères is one of the most individual appellations of the Languedoc. Although it produces white and rosé
wines the appellation is most famous for its rich, ripe red wines made from the classic Rhone varieties Syrah,
Grenache and Mourvedre. The Faugères wine appellation was created in 1982 and is now producing
consistently excellent wines, the secret being in the steep hills surrounding the village of Faugères where the
schist, or decayed slate, provides unique soil drainage and moisture retention and introduces distinctive
minerality into the wine. The Mediterranean climate of long, hot summers and short cold winters is tempered
by Faugères’ proximity to the coast, which produces distinctive and elegant wines.
Faugères is a compact vineyard compared to many of the other appellations of the Languedoc, but the variety
is infinite, prompted by the human hand and the perceptible differences between the different villages. The
white wine, which accounts for just 2% of the appellation, is a perfect example of the way the white wines of
the Languedoc are developing and improving with every vintage, their wonderful herbal flavours conjuring
up the scents of the herbs of the garrigue, fennel, bay and thyme. Pink Faugères, which accounts for 18% of
the appellation, provides delicious refreshing drinking with acidity and delicate fruit. The wines of Faugères
always have a distinctive freshness which places them amongst the finest of the Languedoc.
Rosemary George’s The wines of Faugères is a comprehensive guide to the wines of a remarkably compact
and homogeneous area which covers just seven villages and a couple of hamlets. The wines of Faugères
covers the history, geography and climate of the region, as well as its grape varieties and viticulture, before
profiling the individual producers and their wines. It ends with an indispensable assessment of vintages
going back to the creation of the appellation in 1982.
Faugères’ wines, currently little known outside of France, are set to become the next global wine discovery,
and Rosemary George’s The wines of Faugères is the most up-to-date and authoritative guide to this
beautiful region and its fascinating wines.
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From reader reviews:

Loris Beal:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information mainly because book is one of
various ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually
more imaginative. When you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine
the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other individuals.
When you read this The wines of Faugères (The Classic Wine Library), you could tells your family, friends
as well as soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a book.

Wallace Long:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
guide that need more time to be read. The wines of Faugères (The Classic Wine Library) can be your answer
mainly because it can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.

Teresa Spillman:

The book untitled The wines of Faugères (The Classic Wine Library) contain a lot of information on this.
The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do
not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The author brings you in the
new period of time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can please read on your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go through.

Wilma Tovar:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for your requirements is The wines of Faugères (The Classic Wine Library) this publication
consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how
does the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand.
Typically the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.
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