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Teaching Gong Yoga is the first comprehensive book on using the sound of the Gong to enhance the
practices of Yoga, including asana, pranayama, mantra, meditation and relaxation. Gong players, sound
healers, yoga teachers, and students will learn how the gong can be used in all types of yoga, including:
Kundalini Yoga • Hatha Yoga • Vinyasa Flow Yoga • Ashtanga Yoga Restorative Yoga • Prenatal Yoga •
Children's Yoga • Senior's Yoga You will learn the theory and practice for: • Constructing and teaching
Gong Yoga classes • Playing the Gong for the chakras • Practicing meditation with the Gong • Using gong
maps to develop your playing techniques • Creating deep relaxation and healing through the Gong Fully
illustrated with nearly 100 drawings and 23 tables of information on these and other topics: Asana Sequences
with the Gong Sound, Prana and the Five Tattvas Playing the Gong for the Chakras Pranayama Practices and
the Gong The Gong, Mantras and the Inner Sounds Mudras and Gong Meditation The Gong and Yoga Nidra
... Plus special yoga practices for gong players and teachers Mehtab is the originator and author of Gong
Yoga, the first book on using the gong in the practice of yoga. He has trained hundreds of yoga teachers,
therapists and musicians in the art of playing the gong, and created the DVD course How To Play the Gong
for Yoga, Meditation and Healing.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Burritt:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get large amount of
stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are you experiencing when
the spare time coming to a person of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading
textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the particular book you have read will
be Teaching Gong Yoga.

Jimmy Hicks:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Teaching Gong Yoga the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
not known for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a guide then become one
type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get ahead of. The Teaching Gong Yoga giving
you another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful details for your better
life in this particular era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind is going to be
pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary
paying spare time activity?

Stanley Wells:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look likes.
Maybe you answer might be Teaching Gong Yoga why because the great cover that make you consider
concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps
cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Daniel Slater:

You can obtain this Teaching Gong Yoga by go to the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may
to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not
only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now,
you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current
ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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