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Completely rewritten for 2017, Revenue Recognition Guide is a comprehensive reference manual that
addresses authoritative literature on revenue recognition that must be adopted by public companies by 2018.
Revenue Recognition Guide clarifies concepts and principles, and provides insight into issues that have been
addressed as the accounting profession prepares to adopt the new guidance. Overall the Guide provides: ·
Expert, independent analysis of the new FASB and IASB principles-based standards for revenue recognition
· Plain English discussion of all aspects of the standards · Explanations and illustrations of key points and
judgments · Illustrations and Practice Pointers highlighting key consequences of the accounting guidance and
identifying issues to watch for when dealing with certain revenue transactions · Discussion of issues that are
important to the SEC · References to pertinent paragraphs of the authoritative literature and to GAAP
examples addressing key points This edition of the Revenue Recognition Guide is the first to focus on the
new revenue recognition standards in Topic 606 and IFRS 15. Although the new standard is not mandatorily
effective until 2018, this Guide provides information for companies currently preparing for adoption.
Readers interested in a discussion of U.S. GAAP that is still applicable prior to the adoption of Topic 606,
should consult earlier versions of the Guide. Because the FASB and IASB issued converged standards, the
discussion in this book is also applicable under IFRS. References to the authoritative literature include both
U.S. GAAP (Topic 606) and IFRS (IFRS 15) references. The few narrow differences between Topic 606 and
IFRS 15 are identified in the discussion of the applicable topics. How Is This Guide Organized? Revenue
Recognition Guide is organized into 15 chapters containing a number of Observations and Practice Pointers
that highlight key consequences of the accounting guidance and identify issues to watch for when dealing
with certain revenue transactions. SEC Registrant Alerts highlight issues that the SEC is particularly focused
on, as well as additional guidance provided by the SEC beyond the guidance typically followed by non-
public companies. To facilitate research, the text includes references to pertinent paragraphs of the
authoritative literature addressing key points. Objectives and Framework Chapter 2, Scope and Overview of
Topic 606/IFRS 15, explains the objectives and core principles of the new revenue recognition standards,
and provides a high-level discussion of the five-step model that frames the guidance in the standards on
determining the amount of revenue and the timing of revenue recognition. Chapter 2, Scope and Overview of
Topic 606/IFRS 15, also discusses the scope of the new guidance. Chapters 3-7 provide a detailed discussion
of each of the five steps in the model, including implementation guidance in the standard, as well as
guidance that has resulted from discussions of the TRG. Related Matters Chapter 8, Continuing Involvement,
discusses guidance in Topic 606/IFRS 15 on certain additional matters, including common contract terms
such as warranties, rights of return, repurchase provisions, and option for additional goods and services.
Chapter 9, Costs of Contracts with Customers, addresses the guidance on costs of revenue transactions.
Chapter 10, Presentation, addresses matters of the presentation of revenue transactions in balance sheets and
income statements, including discussion of whether to recognize transactions on a gross or net basis.
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From reader reviews:

Forest Nelson:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a publication your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For you personally who want to start reading a book, we give you that Revenue Recognition
Guide (2017) book as basic and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Jill Williams:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Revenue Recognition Guide (2017) book
because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Joseph Yancey:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you study a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also soon.
The Revenue Recognition Guide (2017) provide you with new experience in examining a book.

Pamela Eckert:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This Revenue Recognition Guide (2017) can give you a lot of
friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make an individual
more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This publication offer
you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be
great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have Revenue Recognition Guide (2017).
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