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The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying
The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying responds to the rapidly changing attitudes towards the use of another's
ideas, styles, and artworks. With advances in technology making the copying of artworks and other artefacts
exponentially easier, questions of copying no longer focus on the problems of forgery: they now expand into
aesthetic and ethical legal concerns. This volume addresses the changes and provides the first philosophical
foundation for an aesthetics and ethics of copying.

Scholars from philosophy of art, philosophy of technology, philosophy of law, ethics, legal theory, media
studies, art history, literary theory, and sociology discuss the role that copying plays in human culture,
confronting the question of how-and why-copying fits into our broader system of values. Teasing out the
factors and conceptual distinctions that must be accounted for in an ontology of copying, they set a
groundwork for understanding the nature of copies and copying, showing how these interweave with ethical
and legal concepts. Covering unique concerns for copying in the domain of artworks, from music and art to
plays and literature, contributors look at work by artists including Heinrich von Kleist, Robert Rauschenberg,
Courbet and Manet and conclude with the normative dimensions of copying in the twenty-first century.

By bringing this topic into the philosophical domain and highlighting its philosophical relevance, The
Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying establishes the complex conditions-ontological, aesthetic, ethical, cultural,
and legal-that underlie and complicate the topic. The result is a timely collection that establishes the need for
further discussion.
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From reader reviews:

Antoinette Hogg:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying. Try to make book
The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying as your close friend. It means that it can being your friend when you
sense alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you
personally. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the
book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Alexander Taylor:

The book The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying can give more knowledge and information about everything
you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book The Aesthetics and Ethics of
Copying? Some of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many facts
for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or information that
you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book The Aesthetics and Ethics
of Copying has simple shape however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the
enormous world by start and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Sue Eldred:

The event that you get from The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying will be the more deep you digging the
information that hide in the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book
is hard to understand but The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying giving you buzz feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood simply by anyone who read it because the
author of this guide is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your current vocabulary increase
well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
recommend you for having this particular The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying instantly.

Shirley Pedro:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This specific The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying can give
you a lot of good friends because by you investigating this one book you have thing that they don't and make
anyone more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve
offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than other make you to
be great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Aesthetics and Ethics of Copying.
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